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Recent articles have outlined the negative returns facing producers with lower corn and soybean prices 
and production costs which have only partially adjusted down from highs in 2023. The variable cash lease 
design has been gaining traction in recent years as a way for farmer tenants to achieve some risk-sharing 
while also avoiding some of the inconveniences associated with asking landlords to be involved with 
managerial decisions as is required by a traditional share lease.  Today’s article highlights how revenue-
based variable leases can still result in large negative farmer returns in the current economic environment 
where cost adjustments are lagged and smaller in size than the revenue reductions facing producers. 

Recent Performance of Variable Cash Rent 

A number of previous articles have outlined a relatively simple design for a variable cash lease (see 
farmdoc daily articles from October 24, 2023 and September 20, 2022 for the most recent examples). 
This design applies a rent factor to crop revenues to determine the cash rent level for the year. The 
variable design also includes both minimum and maximum rent levels.  The minimum establishes a 
meaningful base to ensure the lease is viewed as a cash lease by the Farm Service Agency. This 
provides the landowner with a minimum rental return and eliminates the need to be involved with 
commodity programs such as ARC and PLC.  The maximum rent establishes a cap on the rent paid by 
the farmer tenant in any given year.  

Crop- and region-specific rent factor suggestions for Illinois have been provided, being set at levels which 
result in variable cash rent levels being equal to fixed cash rent levels, on average, over time using 
historical return information. Table 1 provides an update to those rent factors, utilizing historical corn and 
soybean returns in Illinois from 2000 through 2023. The updated rent factors are very similar to those 
based on 2000 to 2022 returns (see farmdoc daily from October 24, 2023). For northern and central 
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Illinois regions they are around 30% for corn and 40% for soybeans.  Rent factors for southern Illinois are 
lower at 23% for corn and 30% for soybeans. 

 

The variable cash lease strikes a balance between risk sharing and managerial convenience for the 
farmer tenant and landlord.  Rent levels adjust to changes in crop revenues, reflecting the effects of 
changes in price and yield, while keeping managerial decisions under the purview of the farmer. 

However, the economic conditions facing producers since 2023 have resulted in potentially large negative 
farmer returns under the variable lease design.  This is because it is based on crop revenues and, unlike 
the traditional share rent, does not include production costs in determining rent levels.   

Both corn and soybean prices have been on a declining trajectory from the record highs experienced 
during the 2022 crop year. Costs have also started to show signs of downward adjustments or plateaus 
but, as is typical, those adjustments lag those of crop revenues and have been smaller in magnitude.  
Thus, adjustments in revenue-based variable cash leases have been insufficient in avoiding negative 
farmer returns on variable cash rented land for 2023 and this is expected to continue for 2024 and into 
2025. 

Table 2 illustrates the situation for a 50-50 corn-soybean rotation in central Illinois for high-productivity 
farmland.  Crop revenues declined by 24% in 2023 compared with 2022 and are projected to be another 
7% lower for 2024 and then holding steady for 2025.  Non-land costs continued to increase by 9% in 
2023 and are projected to decline by 7% in 2024 and another 4% in 2025.  Variable cash rent adjusted 
down proportionally with revenues in 2023, but the higher costs resulted in negative farmer returns in 
2023. Farmer returns under a variable cash lease are currently projected to improve relative to the 
previous year in 2024 and 2025 but remain at negative levels. 

2023

Average

Cash

Region Corn Soybeans Rent Corn Soybeans

North 228 69 315 30% 41%

Central - High 236 75 358 31% 41%

Central - Low 222 68 287 29% 39%

South 195 61 202 23% 30%

Table 1. Expected 2025 Yields, Average 2023 Cash Rents, and Equivalent Variable 

Cash Rent Factors by Region of Illinois

1
 Application of this rent factor to crop revenue causes a variable cash rent to equal the average cash rent 

from 2000 to 2023.

Equivalent

Rent Factors 12025 Yields

Expected
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Discussion   

Lower commodity prices have led to significantly lower crop revenues since 2022.  Non-land production 
costs have begun to adjust downward but have lagged and been smaller than the revenue declines. This 
has resulted in negative farmer returns under revenue-based variable cash lease designs in 2023, and 
projected for 2024 and 2025.   

The variable cash lease design has been gaining traction in recent years as farmer tenants seek to 
achieve more risk-sharing without the managerial headaches that can be introduced with traditional share 
leases. Relative to a fixed cash rent situation the variable cash lease is projected to result in better farmer 
returns when revenues decline, as variable rents adjust more quickly than fixed cash rents. However, the 
economic situation facing producers since 2023 highlights the risk-sharing gap that remains if variable 
lease designs adjust only to changes in crop revenues.  

Development of a strategy for approaching farmland rents is critical for farm operations seeking financial 
sustainability and viability.  This is particularly true during periods of low returns (see farmdoc daily from 
October 8, 2024). As the balance between corn and soybean prices and productions costs continues to 
adjust, producers may need to propose further adjustments to rents determined through variable cash 
lease designs to minimize losses during highly negative farmer return periods (see farmdoc daily from 
October 1, 2024).  

A simple adjustment could be a one-time reduction in the rent from variable leases by a set amount per 
acre.  While individual situations can vary greatly, the 2025 Illinois crop budgets suggest reductions of 
$40 per acre, or more, might be needed to result in break-even farmer returns for the higher productivity 
soils in northern and central Illinois. Budgets suggest even larger adjustments may be needed on lower 
productivity soils in central and southern Illinois.  Smaller rent adjustments would help to reduce projected 
losses in 2025, while recognizing the landowner’s perspective and desire to earn a return on their land 
asset as well as the fact that volatility in returns to crop production should be expected and considered in 
producers’ overall financial risk management plans.  

2022 2023 2024P 2025P

Crop Revenues ($/acre) $1,237 $946 $884 $886

Non-land Costs ($/acre) $633 $693 $642 $619

Operator and Land Return1 $607 $266 $252 $277

Variable Cash Rent $429 $341 $319 $318

Farmer Return with Variable Cash Rent $178 -$75 -$67 -$41

% Change from previous year:

Crop Revenues -24% -7% 0%

Non-Land Costs 9% -7% -4%

Operator and Land Return -56% -5% 10%

Variable Cash Rent -21% -6% 0%

Farmer Return with Variable Cash Rent -142% 10% 39%

Table 2. Crop Revenues, Non-Land Costs, Variable Rents and Returns since 2022,                                                                                                              

Central Illinois High-Productivity Farmland, 50-50 Corn-Soybean Rotation

Note: Values for 2022 and 2023 are based on historic revenues and costs for Illinois farms summarized by 

Illinois Farm Business Farm Management.  Values for 2024 and 2025 are projections from the September 

release of 2025 Illinois Crop Budgets.

1
Equals total revenue (crop revenue, government payments, crop insurance proceeds) less non-land costs
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